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Background
	 In less developed regions including East Asia and Latin America, 
there is increased in numbers of older adult in the population. There 
is evidence of a shift in population age structure worldwide which is 
caused by rapid declines in fertility and mortality [1]. As the world’s 
population continues to age, forecasts show that this trend will contin-
ue [2,3] and the proportion of persons 65years and older is projected 
to increase sharply in coming years [4,5]. Ghana’s population aged 60 
and over will account for more than 11% by 2050, and also account 
for 21.1% of the global population. Ageing is happening irrespective 
of socio-economic hardship, widespread poverty, Human Immuno-
deficiency Virus/Acquired Immunodeficiency Diseases (HIV/AIDS) 
and COVID 19 pandemic and the rapid evolution of the traditional 
extended family structure [6].

Aged Support
	 Families are the key social groups in which older people are kept 
and maintained [7], and critical in understanding challenges and op-
portunities of ageing [8]. The emergence of gerontological interven-
tions has raised concerns about destruction of customary family care 
systems and a pending “disaster” of old-age sustenance [9,10]. The 
importance of the role played by the elderly in nation building cannot 
be over- emphasised. Asiyanbola [11] pointed out that they are the 
guardians of culture and tradition, peacekeepers during conflicts reso-
lution and promoters in enforcing peace in their various communities; 
adding that the aged tend to live with their families, usually with an 
adult son and daughter, with some variation across countries as to 
the preferred co-resident. Living with or near the family is crucial 
for maintenance of support since the aged need help with activities 
such as cooking or shopping, as well as physical and psychological 
support, particularly when they no longer work for a salary and begin 
to suffer from illnesses that restrict their capacity to carry out activ-
ities necessary for day-to-day survival [12]. In addition to the usual 
physical, mental and physiological changes associated with ageing, 
old people are very often disadvantaged by lack of social security for 
their everyday social and economic needs [13]. Care for needy mem-
bers is a core element of family life. As also seen elsewhere, older 
people in Sub-Saharan Africa (SSA) play roles both as care givers 
to orphans and vulnerable children in situations of HIV, poverty, and 
labour-related relocations [14,15] and as recipients of long-term care. 
Many older persons reach retirement age in a state of poverty and 
deprivation, with poor access to health care and poor dietary intake. 
The care and support by the family and community that was previ-
ously taken for granted is not there because of changes in society due 
to urbanization and expansion [16]. This leaves the aged with insuffi-
cient personal savings to meet their daily needs [5,16]. The aged are 
often denied their right to pension, resulting in poor well-being which  
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Abstract

	 Sub-Saharan Africa, a deprived region in the world is rapidly in-
creasing with the aged. This is worrying because of the enormous 
of issue of ageing. The aim of this paper is to review the evidence 
of care in a published paper on care of the aged at home. The Pre-
ferred Reporting Items for Systematic reviews and Meta-Analysis 
(PRISMA) framework for systematic literature reviews and Pop-
ulation, Intervention, Comparison and Outcome (PICO) methods 
were used to track the eligibility of the research question. Consid-
ering the paucity of the evidence on caring for the aged, this meth-
od was the most appropriate for use to explore the preposition. 
The research was performed using five electronic databases from 
January 2017 and July 2017 taking into consideration set inclusion 
and exclusion criteria. Only studies in English were considered and 
a total of 18 articles met the study criteria. Reviewers pulled out 
primary studies in the form of quantitative, qualitative and editorial 
reports. The literature reviewed showed shortcomings in reporting 
on care for the aged at home and a lack of high-quality scientific 
evidence for Ghana. Six core themes were generated: neglect of 
aged care; aged care for the younger generation; aged living ar-
rangements; government neglect; preparedness; and care of the 
aged in Ghana. The review offered significant insight into care for 
the aged in their homes. The rigorous approach used provided a 
good understanding of underlying issues on the needs of the aged.
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becomes a crucial concern in view of their dependence on family sup-
port networks, as is clearly apparent in most parts of Sub-Saharan 
Africa [17,18].

Aim

	 The aim of this paper is to review the evidence of care in a pub-
lished paper on care of the aged at home in the Ghanaian society.

Methods

	 A PRISMA scoping review method was used to guide the study 
where emphasis was laid on collecting and critically analysing stud-
ies, using methods that made use of one or more research questions. 
Considering the absence of evidence of care of the aged living at 
home, this method was chosen as the most appropriate way to explore 
what literature was available from a range of scientific sources. For 
rigour in the review process, the process followed the four stages rec-
ommended in the framework developed by Moher et al., [19]: prob-
lem identification, literature search, data evaluation and data analysis. 
Figure 1 is the prisma framework adopted for study.

Literature search stage

The literature research was done from PubMed, EBSCOhost (CI-
NAHL, science Direct), Google scholar and Grey literature. The 
search duration was from January to May 2017. A thirty-one-year 
interval (from January 1985 to December 2016) was adopted as the 
time frame of published articles in view of the fact that current studies 
in aged care mostly focus on institutional care. The search terms used 
were elderly care/ aged care AND policy AND assisted living AND 
Cape Coast Metropolitan area/ Ghana/ sub-Saharan African AND 
caretakers/caregivers AND community care / home care. This review  

has been registered and published in the PROSPERO international 
prospective register of scoping reviews. It is registered under the fol-
lowing number: - CDR42016049096.

Inclusion and exclusion criteria

	 Studies considered eligible for the review were those that were in 
English, reported findings and presented data on elderly care and on 
issues and conditions associated with aged persons living at home in 
Ghana and the sub-Saharan African region. Studies using qualitative, 
quantitative and mixed methods published in peer-reviewed journals 
were included. The inclusion criterion for study populations was sub-
jects aged 50years and upwards.

Data collection stages

	 Three reviewers with distinct roles undertook the study. The first 
reviewer came out with the construct idea and appropriate keywords 
that were in line to help answer research questions. The second and 
third reviewers were fed with the idea and they also made their input. 
The first and second reviewers designed a data collection template by 
means of google folder and independently extracted data focusing on 
the proved keywords looking at the title of papers on issues involving 
the aged ageing in place globally. This approach pulled out about a 
million and a half articles. The procedure was repeated with a time 
frame limited to 1985 and 2016. A total of 490 articles were accepted 
by the two reviewers. The data was edited, those that were overlap-
ping had the duplicates removed thereby arriving at 391. To further 
narrow the articles to be considered for the study, another template 
was designed with limitation in geographical access to sub Saharan 
Africa and to aged being cared for in the community (ageing-in-place) 
looking at abstract only. Reviewers screened abstracts and realized 
that 31 studies overlapped and were subsequently removed. So ab-
stract screening started with 360 articles. Abstract of the 360 articles 
were obtained and independently reviewed by the first and second 
reviewers. This phase generated 128 papers after rejecting 232 papers 
which did not meet reviewers laid down criteria. Data was again edit-
ed, and duplicated papers removed. The third reviewer always met the 
two reviewers for discussion before a phase began. After a decision 
was reached by the three reviewers the 128 papers were given a full 
text review taking into consideration the research questions and issues 
of caregivers in assisted living, Ghana and home care. Eighty-seven 
studies were rejected because they were studies that concentrated on 
caregivers and restricted to SSA but not on care of the aged. Forty-one 
papers were conclusively accepted by the reviewers after it was edit-
ed, and duplicates removed. The team decided to intuitively read se-
lected articles considering the geographical location of the study and 
excluding data from institutional care. 18 papers were finally agreed 
on to be used by the reviewers for the study. From an initial total of 
391 studies, 304 were excluded because on closer inspection they did 
not fully meet the inclusion criteria, resulting in an eventual total of 
128 papers of which, 41 were conclusively accepted for the review 
and 18 finally agreed with.

Data evaluation stage

	 The final 18 accepted studies were identified for inclusion (Figure 
2). To validate the quality of the eighteen articles, a checklist of 21 
items, satisfying five sections from Mixed Methods Appraisal Tools 
(MMAT), was used to inform judgments on the quality of each article 
regardless of study type. Each of the 18 articles were individually 

Figure 1: A PRISMA flow chart showing phases of the literature search for the review.

http://doi.org/10.24966/GGM-8662/100052


Citation: Aboh IK, Druye AA (2020) A Review of the Evidence of Care for the Ghanaian Aged. J Gerontol Geriatr Med 6: 052.

• Page 3 of 7 •

J Gerontol Geriatr Med ISSN: 2381-8662, Open Access Journal
DOI: 10.24966/GGM-8662/100052

Volume 6 • Issue 2 • 100052

reviewed for quality by the two reviewers and classified as being 
good, satisfactory or having some limitations. 10 were classified as 
good, 5 came out with satisfactory and 3 had some limitations after a 
face-to-face meeting to analyse the findings and to establish harmony. 
The review showed scanty literature in caring for the aged in sub-Sa-
haran Africa, because the purpose of the search was to extract the 
evidence in documented literature on the care of the aged.

Data analysis stage

	 Following the PRISMA evaluation, analysis of the studies was de-
veloped inductively, focusing on how the aged are cared for in their 
own homes. The data analysis included reduction, display, compari-
son, conclusion-drawing and verification of the data [19]. Rigorous 
examination of the displayed data was put into themes. The themes 
were developed taking into consideration type of study, region of 
study, number of study participants/respondents and similarities and 
differences between outcomes in the data. Six themes emerged: ne-
glect of the aged, aged caring for younger generation, aged living 
arrangements, government attitude, preparedness and care of the aged 
in Ghana.

Results
Description of the data

	 The review found in the data selected seven qualitative studies, 
seven quantitative and four critical reviews, each using either an ex-
ploratory descriptive or a case study design. Articles were limited to 
the sub-Saharan African region: Ghana (seven studies), Nigeria (two 
studies), South Africa (two studies), Botswana (one study), Ken-
ya (one study) and sub-Saharan Africa (five studies). Most studies 

focused on caring and health seeking behaviours of the aged. No 
substantial differences were found between the themes dealt with in 
the studies despite their diversity of the regional contexts. Number of 
participants or samples sizes in the studies varied from 5 to 6206. In 
all the studies, the aged were mostly women, with age ranging from 
50 years to 79 years.

Evidence of care

Theme 1: Neglect of care for the aged

	 There was a strong argument that even though of high priority, 
the health of older people aged 60 years and above, were deteriorated 
to the point that where they need care, the responsibility fell on a 
younger female kin, whose own health, employment and education 
opportunities was affected [2]. Aboderin and Bread opined that, in 
sub-Saharan Africa, impaired health in old age affects not only the 
older individuals themselves, but also families and communities and 
the wider prospects for development. A large proportion of older Af-
ricans lack the requisite care. A WHO report on Adult Health and 
Ageing in Ghana, showed 96% of older adults with hypertension do 
not receive adequate treatment for the disorder [20]. There are also 
certain aspects of behaviour that are unacceptable, such as neglect of 
the elderly and lack of respect for the elderly [2,20]. Caring for people 
in need is closely linked to the concept of ubuntu as seen among peo-
ple in Mpumalanga, South Africa, as an obligation and a symbol of 
respect [20]. In the absence of formal care, older women are the pri-
mary caregivers in the community, and they have a network of friends 
and relatives they care for when support is needed [21]. Care is also 
extended to other older people who are neglected, frail, confused or 
who lack support from family [20]. Sometimes these older people are 
abandoned, neglected by their families and face physical abuse. Wid-
ows in particular are the more likely to suffer abuse and some cases 
may be subjected to accusations of witchcraft [1].

Theme 2: Aged caring for younger generations

	 The caring function is very important in everyday settings of pov-
erty or labour-related parental absence. In the urban slums of Nairobi, 
Kenya, around 30% of older women and 20% of older men (aged 
60years and over) care for one or more non-biological child [2,13]. 
A significant proportion of older adults live with orphaned grand-
children. Across the sub-Saharan African region, around 8% of older 
adults live with a grandchild who has at least one deceased parent, 
while 1.7% lived with a grandchild whose parents are both deceased 
due to the AIDS epidemics [12]. Some older people work because of 
their economic needs, while others are attracted by the social con-
tacts, intellectual challenges, or sense of value that work often pro-
vides [6]. Some are expect to depend on their children but instead 
have to care for grandchildren, which is an unexpected role changed 
and very taxing [21]. Making elderly women caregivers, instead of re-
laxing and enjoying the fruits of their labour. Kimuna and Makiwane 
[22] showed that older people in Mpumalanga are an important social 
resource as breadwinners, using their meagre, means-tested pensions 
and providing basic needs, such as health care and education for the 
members of their households. Traditionally, older women, cared for 
their grandchildren when their daughters and son left for work in the 
fields or in the cities, or when high number of HIV/AIDS-related 
deaths meant that children needed to be cared for who no longer had 
parents to support them. Kimuna and Makiwane also found that even 
though the primary aim of the old age pension in Mpumalanga was to  

Figure 2: Modified PRISMA framework for the review.
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give support to older people, it went towards supporting members of 
their household rather than the needs of the older people themselves, 
with the pension benefit becoming the main source of household in-
come. Older women heading households provided care even though 
they lacked the necessary resources to sustain a family and are in most 
cases widows who had not inherited anything from their husbands or 
from the parents of the orphaned grandchildren under their care [22].

Theme 3: Aged living arrangement

	 There is evidence that education promotes living independently, 
often as a feature of modernization [23]. Urban elderly do live alone 
or with their children only as compared to their rural counterparts. 
This could be due to cultural norm, when better-off family members 
are required by tradition to support other family members, including 
co-existing [12]. Zimmer and Dayton [12] add that it is women rath-
er than men that have such living arrangements and they have more 
children-in-law and grandchildren to live with. Another possibility is 
that when her husband dies, a woman moves in with her extended 
family. Men living with children and grandchildren are tied to living 
with spouse. Household composition is also related to well-being: 
Well-being of elderly people who are separated is inferior to that of 
any marital groups. In rural Nigeria, it commonly occurs that women 
or men who are separated and lived alone are not accorded respect 
and are often stigmatized and marginalized in ways that affects their 
health; thus, they experience psychological stress which can have se-
rious effect on their well-being [6]. Despite increasing urbanisation, 
older people in Ghana live in rural areas where health and social ser-
vices are inadequate [24].

Theme 4: Government attitude

	 Government indifference toward the elderly leads in some in-
stances of total neglect of their health and financial needs. In Nige-
ria, no policy or social security system has been put in place to care 
for people in their old age. The primary health care system makes 
no special provision for health care for the elderly and even in the 
overall health policy no special mention is made of the elderly [6]. 
According to Adebowale et al., [12] education has strong positive 
influence on their well-being; educated elderly people are likely to 
receive higher monthly pension, be more knowledgeable about pre-
vention and treatment of diseases, and live in a clean environment. 
Kabir and colleagues have documented that education is inversely re-
lated to the incidence of diseases among the elderly [4,6]. Some older 
people reported that they have been affected by HIV/AIDS through 
loss of community support and neglect of their day-to-day needs [25]. 
Formal care provision for disabled elderly persons living in the com-
munity is not available in Nigeria. Some elderly have some form of 
disability, did not have a caregiver to help in area of limitation [26].

Theme 5: Preparedness for old age

	 Former employee of public or private organisation who are enti-
tled to a gratuity or pension from monthly salary deductions while in 
active service often never receive these dues because of bureaucratic 
inadequacies in the organisation where they served [6]. As a conse-
quence of poverty and poor infrastructure, elderly people in Ghana 
and Nigeria not only have reduced life expectancy but also spend 
more of their lifetimes in poor health. Governments have a relaxed 
attitude to the family structures which have traditionally provided 
care for elderly are on the verge of collapse. All these factors have  

an adverse effect on the health of the elderly and compromise their 
well-being [6]. To the Ghanaian, a house is a symbol of success, af-
fording its owner respect, love, happiness and security in old age; it 
is a thing of beauty and it provides a sense of belonging, of ‘home’, 
both physically and symbolically [27]. People with houses have more 
properly organised funerals than those without a house. If you don’t 
have a house, any kind of funeral can be organised for you [27]. How-
ever, the dream of having somewhere safe to stay when one is old 
and dependent does not always come true. Van der Geest [27] was 
proudly informed by a respondent that when he was a child it was his 
dream to build a house for himself, which he did by age 45, ‘And now 
I have my peace, comfort and everything’, Two years later, however, 
the informant was one of the loneliest and most miserable elderly 
individuals in the study. He was practically blind, his wife had died, 
and all his twenty children were living elsewhere; he spent the whole 
day lying on a bed without a sheet or cloth [27].

Theme 6: Care of the aged in Ghana

	 The relative merits of maintaining the tradition of home-based care 
versus embracing a transition to long-term institutional care (nursing 
homes or aged-care homes, frail-care homes, etc.,) are increasingly a 
matter of controversy. For most African and African-descent ethnici-
ties, caring for family in the home is regarded as a moral imperative 
and a family responsibility [28]. This strong sense of family respon-
sibility is seen in African- Americans descents. Traditionally, support 
in the African culture takes the form of intergenerational reciprocal 
care [28], which is an obligation and sign of respect [20]. Traditional 
intergenerational caregiving is still foremost in providing home-based 
care and community-based care for the sick and the frail. Some South 
Africans would want to stay in their own homes and not go to an old-
age home (i.e., nursing homes) or any frail-care services available. 
However, as lifespans increase and with global ageing, family respon-
sibility for maintaining home-based care will be difficult to sustain 
and more older Africans will become institutionalised. Urbanisation 
leads to a transition from traditional home care to institutionalised 
care, as children and grandchildren caregivers relocate to cities [28].

	 It is difficult to get a clear picture of the care that old people in 
Ghana enjoy. Some successful elderly have been able to give their 
children good education, resulting in a good social position. These 
people are usually fortunate to have their children taking good care of 
them, buying them everything that they need, including clothes and 
luxury items such as clocks, watches, radios, lanterns and ornaments 
[29]. The houses of such people are often filled with children, nieces, 
nephews and grandchildren. Their good quality of life attracts rela-
tives who bring company and presents. The quality of life of the less 
well-to-do elderly is harder to quantity. There are elderly people who 
contradict themselves, complaining at time that they have no money 
for food, that their children are far away and seldomly visit them, 
and that their children do not send them enough money to live com-
fortably, and at other times praising their children for the way they 
look after them. In admission that their children’s neglect would call 
shame on them. Many emphasise that their children do what they can 
to assist them [30]. Whether it was the gloomy side of their situation 
or the bright side that they emphasised when they were interviewed 
depended on the situation in which the interview took place. If an old 
person’s relationship with the interviewer was easy and there were 
no other people listening, the interviewee would be more inclined 
to reveal his or her worries; otherwise they preferred to keep up a 
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respectable appearance [30]. The real situation in receiving care in 
Ghana is far more complex, several people usually provide care, and 
who does what is very much a matter of who happens to be around. 
Care is often managed on a day-to-day basis, with considerable im-
provisations [30].

Discussion
	 Despite the large number of articles that focused on the issue of the 
aged, only a few addressed caring of elderly people living at home. 
The studies reviewed were studies from countries in sub-Saharan Af-
rica that focused on quality of care for the aged. Not all 18 studies 
dealt with every one of these themes, but in at least nine of the studies 
most of them were involved. Neglect of the aged, aged caring for 
younger relatives, and aged’s living arrangements were dealt with in 9 
articles. Government neglect, preparedness for old age and care of the 
aged in Ghana were also discussed in 9 articles. However, only one 
article explicitly spelt out the type of care elderly people received at 
home. It was easier to identify support given to younger relatives by 
the aged and how tired they get. The article also showed how the el-
derly people’s meagre pensions go to support the welfare of younger 
relatives, leaving the pensioners with nothing. Men are not strong and 
brave enough to cope with loneliness and the shame of being single, 
so they are always either married and living with a spouse or living 
with a single child [6]. In the Ghanaian Akan community, investment 
in building house thinking that it will be a guarantee of care in one’s 
old age may be a detriment of care, so that one could end up lonely in 
one’s old age [30]. There was a lot consistency among the variables, 
possibly reflecting similar results emanating from the view that the 
SSA culture and behaviour to care was almost similar. Attention was 
paid to generalization, interpretation and application of the results ob-
tained. In the context on the care of the aged in their homes, outcome 
was on frail, demented and adult caregivers. However, conducting a 
scoping review was no guarantee that all articles used were relevant, 
because there could be articles in other languages than English that 
could be useful to study the topic.

Implications
	 This review provided an up-to-date overview of the care of aged 
living at home and indicates there is no obvious difference in the care 
given to these people, regardless of the cultural context. The review 
identified useful literature on care of the aged in SSA. Policy mak-
ers need to emphasise the importance of looking after senior citizens. 
They also need to help their populace plan properly for their own old 
age, regardless of where they live and they must be knowledgeable 
about the needs of elderly in policy and decision making, especially 
in an era scarce resource.
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